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Radisson Blu Resort Fiji Proud Sponsors of Nadi Blazers Team Training Attire 
 
The Radisson Blu Resort Fiji are the avid sponsors of the Nadi Blazers Women’s Rugby team 
travelling polo’s and training vests once again. The resort reaffirmed its ongoing support to the Nadi 
Blazers team with the Official Presentation of polo shirts and training vests which have been used 
since 2015. 
 
With the team looking smart in their branded apparel supplied by the resort, the official presentation 
took place at the hotel lobby with the Radisson Blu Resort Fiji Management team while the Nadi 
Blazers members were treated to light refreshments.  
 
“The Radisson Blu Resort Fiji, is such a wonderful organization whom are very supportive of our local 
community and because of their ongoing support, they enable our women rugby players to be able to 
represent the Nadi & Western region with pride both on the field and off”, says Lailanie Burnes, Team 
Captain for the Nadi Blazers. 
 
"As rugby is a male dominated sport one of the biggest obstacles women rugby players face is the 
lack of financial support at an institutional level unlike our male counterparts whose clubs generally 
are well supported. So for such a large organization as the Radisson Blu to go against the grain of 
normality to support our women ruggers to play the sport that they love is simply wonderful”, says 
Lailanie Burnes. 
 
The Nadi Blazers are looking forward to a great season ahead where they will be participating in all 
major tournaments in the country in addition to defending their title as the reigning premiers of the 
Samoan Independence Day 7s. 
 
The Radisson Blu Resort Fiji is proud to be actively engaged in the local community, benchmarked 
on an international level having won the Responsible Business Award in 2014 and 2016 by Carlson 
Rezidor Group Asia Pacific. “We are delighted to support the team and good causes in the local 
community. With the new uniforms supplied we hope it encourages the team to excel in their 
competitions and development with the sport”, says John Bendtsen. 
 
 
About Carlson Rezidor Hotel Group 

 
Carlson Rezidor Hotel Group is one of the world’s largest and most dynamic hotel groups and 
includes 1,400 hotels in operation and under development with more than 220,000 rooms and a 
footprint spanning 115 countries and territories. The Carlson Rezidor portfolio includes a powerful 
set of global brands: Quorvus Collection, Radisson Blu®, Radisson®, Radisson RED, Park Plaza®, 
Park Inn® ® by Radisson and Country Inn & Suites® by Radisson. In most hotels, guests can benefit 
from Club CarlsonSM, one of the 2015 – 2016 “Top Three Hotel Rewards Programs” as ranked by 
U.S. News and World Report. Carlson Rezidor Hotel Group and its brands employ 90,000 people 
worldwide and is headquartered in Minneapolis, Singapore, and Brussels. For more information, 
visit www.carlsonrezidor.com and follow on Twitter @carlsonrezidor.  

http://www.carlsonrezidor.com/
https://twitter.com/carlsonrezidor


 

 

 
 
 
About Radisson Blu Resort Fiji 
 
Spanning 10 acres of pristine beach, tropical gardens and tranquil architecture, the Radisson Blu 
Resort Fiji, Denarau Island enchants guests with a picturesque setting in paradise. Just 20 minutes 
from the international airport in Fiji, the resort's location caters to both couples and families with 
features like an on-site spa, access to the Denarau Island Golf & Racquet Club and the island's only 
white-water tunnel slide. Guests can feast on world-class cuisine from 6 different dining outlets while 
soaking in romantic waterfront views or cooling their toes in one of the four lagoon pools. With 
charming event facilities and a staff determined to provide 100% Guest Satisfaction, we're ideal for 
weddings, meetings and social gatherings. Learn more at: www.radissonblu.com/resort-fiji.  
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