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MEDIA RELEASE 
 

EXPERT MIXOLOGIST QUYNH NGUYEN ARRIVES AT INTERCONTINENTAL FIJI GOLF RESORT & SPA 
 
(NATADOLA, FIJI) Monday 8th January 2017 – InterContinental Fiji Golf Resort & Spa is pleased to 
welcome professional Mixologist Quynh Nguyen who will reside at the resort for the next three months to 
showcase his expertise and creativity.  Quynh has nine years of extensive bar and lounge experience 
across Dubai, Singapore and Australia, which will lift the already great service and bar experience at 
Natadola Bay to a whole new level worthy of a large international city. 
 
Quynh will be based in Kama Lounge, overlooking the beautiful white sands of Fiji’s best beach.  He will be 
responsible for implementing the new bar experience across all three restaurants and two bars as well as 
Club InterContinental.   
 
His recent work has been at “Fred's” and “Charlie Parkers” in Sydney where both venues have been 
featured prominently as the best bars and restaurants in Sydney, Australia.  Fred's was recently voted 
Delicious Magazine's NSW #1 best restaurant. Charlie Parker's was recognised as the Best Sustainable 
Programme at the Australian Bartender Magazine Bar Awards.  
 

“We are delighted to have someone of Quynh’s calibre at our resort and to engage his expertise.  He will 
assist in the creation of new cocktails that highlight the best of Fiji’s fresh local ingredients and flavours 
with a splash of international flair,” said Craig Wood, InterContinental Fiji’s Director of Dining & 
Entertainment.  
 
“With an emphasis on freshness, locality and innovation, we look forward to delivering a heightened 
experience across our Restaurants & Bars, InterContinental Meetings and Club InterContinental.  Valued 
guests can expect a true sense of place with our well crafted cocktails complimented with amazing vistas 
at Natadola Bay.” 
 
Kama Lounge is InterContinental Fiji's flagship bar.  Offering superb views of Natadola Bay, evening 
entertainment, and renowned Fijian hospitality, it’s the idyllic way to watch the sunset in paradise.   
 
InterContinental Fiji Golf Resort & Spa is part of the Intercontinental Hotel Group (IHG) with over 5,000 
and 744,000 guest rooms in nearly 100 countries.  Overlooking the azure waters of Natadola Beach – 
voted by CNN as one of the best beaches in the world, and Fiji’s finest beach, the resort is spread across 
35 acres of tropical manicured gardens and offers all of the facilities and services expected of luxury 
international resort. 
 
Click here for more news and updates on the InterContinental Fiji Golf Resort & Spa. For more 
information please also visit www.fiji.intercontinental.com or contact the resort on 673 3455 / 
enquiries.fiji@ihg.com  
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